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WP S-4 (schedule is not included in the actual audited financial statement)

BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS
REGISTER OF DEEDS' OFFICE
Schedule of Cash Receipts and Cash Disbursements
For the Year Ended December 31, 2021

Cash Receipts
Heritage trust fees
Recording fees
Technology fees
Copier and other fees

Total Cash Receipts

Cash Disbursements
Heritage trust fees
Recording fees
Technology fees
Copier and other fees

Total Cash Disbursements

Receipts Over (Under) Expenditures
Cash Balance, Beginning of Year

Cash Balance, End of Year

2019 2020 2021
Prior Prior Current
6,663.00 8,678.00 9,802.00
89,498.00 114,908.00 128,606.00
19,989.00 26,034.00 29,406,00
5,481.67 6,117.65 7,007.35
121,631.67 155,737.65 174,821.35
6,663.00 8,678.00 9,802.00
89,498.00 114,908.00 128,606.00
19,989.00 26,034.00 29,406.00
5,481.67 6,117.65 7,007.35
121,631.67 155,737.65 174,821.35

23-Nov-22
02:07 PM

S-4
S-4
S-4
S-4
S-4




WP S-6 (schedule is not included in the actual audited financial statement)

BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS

CORRECTIONAL CENTER - INMATES FUNDS
Schedule of Cash Receipts and Cash Disbursements

For the Year Ended December 31, 2021

Cash Receipts

Inmates’ concessions, telephone, and other
Total Cash Receipts
Cash Disbursements

Inmates’ concessions, telephone, and other
Total Cash Disbursements
Receipts Over (Under) Expenditures

Cash Balance, Beginning of Year

Cash Balance, End of Year

Composition of Balance:
Inmates checking

23-Nov-22
02:67 PM

2018 2020 2021

Actual Actual Actual
216,617.13 173,154.72 $ 387,506.16 S-6.1
216,617.13 173,154,72 387,506.16
209,360.67 172,603.16 345,658.21 S-6.1
209,360.67 172,603.16 345,658.21
7,256.46 551.56 41,847.95
84,340.47 91,596.93 92,148.49
91,596.93 92,148.49 $  133,996.44
84,340.47 92,148.49 $ 133,996.44 5-6.1
84,340.47 92,14849  § 133,996.44




WP S-7 (schedule is not included in the actual andited financial statement)

BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS
COUNTY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE

Schedule of Cash Receipts and Cash Disbursements

For the Year Ended December 31, 2021

Cash Receipts
Fines, court costs, and restitution
Diversion fees collected

Total Cash Receipts

Cash Disbursements
Fines, court costs, restitution and diversion exp
Diversion fees paid to the County

Total Cash Disbursements

Receipts Over (Under) Expenditures

Cash Balance, Beginning of Year

Cash Balance, End of Year

All Current YR info is per wp S-7

2018 2020 2021
Year Year Year
Actual Actual Actual
171,367.90 $ 128,243.87 $ 68,993.89
24,885.00 8,005.00 225.00
196,252,.90 136,248.87 69,218.89
135,098.06 127,405.37 91,612,80
35,621.00 31,035.00 10,350.00
170,719.06 158,440.37 101,962.80
25,533.84 (22,191.50) (32,7439
71,338.21 96,872.05 74,680.55
96,872.05 $  74,0680.55 $ 41,936.64

23-Nov-22
2:07 PM

5-7.2
S-7.2
5-1.2

S-7.2
S-7.2
5-7.2

5-7.2

S-7.2




BOURBON COUNTY

SHERIFF - REGISTERED OFFENDERS
2021 County Offices.xls

December 31, 2021

KSA 22-4904

Landmark - AC# 34436

Month Beg Balance Deposits W/D End Balance
12/31/20 16,833.59
1/29/21 16,833.59 - 2,236.50 14,597.09
2/26/21 14,597.09 1,230.00 - 15,827.09
3/31/21 15,827.09 880.00 - 16,707.09
4/30/21 16,707.09 560.00 1,220.00 16,047.09
5/28/21 16,047.09 850.00 390.00 16,507.09
6/30/21 16,507.09 720.00 - 17,227.09
7/30/21 17,227.09 880.00 - 18,107.09
8/31/21 18,107.09 760.00 - i8,867.09
9/30/21 18,867.09 - - 18,867.09
10/29/21 18,867.09 1,700.00 - 20,567.09
11/30/21 20,567.09 800.00 - 21,367.09
12/31/21 21,367.09 830.00 - 22,197.09
Total 16,833.59 9,210.00 3,846.50 22,197.09
PY OS Cks -
PY O/S Dep - -
CY 08 Cks -
CY O/8 Dep -
CYE Total 16,833.59 9,210.00 3,846.50 22,197.09

Exp - Web Design

Exp - Kim's office & windows
Exp - D&J Glass

The audit was completed in early June when the Direct of Finance, Susan Bancroft, informed us that she was aware of
bank accounts at the sheriffs office that we were not aware of. In late June 1 visited the Shreiff at the county jail

and review the activily in three accounts, which is summarized on wps S-8.1 thru S-8.3. Pertinent statues are filed

at 3-8.4. A sumumary of the activity in these accounts are as foilows:

Process Serving
Coneeal Carry
Registered Offenders
Totals

Balance 2021 2021 Balance
12/31/2020 Receipts Expenses 12/31/2021
$ 141169 § 283254 § 3,25939 % 984.84
1,980.51 1,137.00 470.50 2,647.01
16,833.59 9,210.00 3,846.50 22,197.09
$ 2022579 % 13,17954 % 7,57639 § 2582894

S-8.1




BOURBON COUNTY
SHERIFF - PROCESS SERVING
2021 County Offices.xls
December 31, 2021
KSA 28-110

City State - AC# 10944

Month Beg Balance Deposits W/D End Balance
12/31/20 1,411.69
1/29/21 1,411.69 240.00 188.28 1,463.41
2/26/21 1,463.41 290.00 131.74 1,621.67
3/31/21 1,621.67 430.00 440.48 1,611.19
4/30/21 1,611.19 235.00 131.43 1,714.76
5/28/21 1,714.76 256.00 57111 1,399.65
6/30/21 1,399.65 240.00 633.51 1,606.14
7/30/21 1,006.14 224.50 - 1,230.64
8/31/21 1,230.64 232.04 415.83 1,046.85
9/30/21 1,046.85 260.00 136.25 1,170.60
10/29/21 1,170.60 i20.00 248.75 1,041.85
11/30/21 1,041.85 120.00 69,97 1,091.88
12/31/21 1,001.88 135.00 292.04 984.84
Total 1,411.69 2,832.54 3,259.39 984.84
PY OS Cks -
PY O/S Dep - -
CY OS Cks -
CY OfS Dep -
CYE Total 1,411.69 2,832.54 3,259.39 984,84

Exp - two meals + radio adv

Exp - two meals

Exp - two meals + flowers

Exp - three meals + flowers

Exp - four meals + § general(39) + Walmart (38)
Exp - sixr meals + Walmrt(34)

Walmart & Meals
Wwalmart & meals

Meals

S-8.2




BOURBON COUNTY
SHERIFF - CONCEAL CARRY
2021 County Offices.xls
December 31, 2021

KSA 75-7c05

Landmark - AC# 33820

Month Beg Balance Deposits W/D End Balance
12/31/20 1,980.51
1/29/21 1,980.51 130.00 - 2,110.51
2/26/21 2,110.51 32.50 - 2,143.01
3/31/21 2,143.01 195.00 470.50 1,867.51
4/30/21 1,867.51 195.00 - 2,062.51
5/28/21 2,062,51 65.00 - 2,127.51
6/30/21 2,127.51 - - 0 2,127.51
7/30/21 2,127.51 162.50 - 2,290.01
8/31/21 2,290.01 32.50 - 2,322.51
9/30/21 2,322.51 130.00 - 2,452.51
10/29/21 2,452.51 130.00 - 2,582.51
11/30/21 2,582.51 - - 2,582.51
12/31/21 2,582.51 64.50 - 2,647.01
Total 1,980.51 1,137.00 470,50 '2,647.01
PY OS Cks -
PY O/S Dep - -
CY OS Cks -
CY O/S Dep -
CYE Total 1,980.51 1,137.00 470.50 2,647.01

Training targets

S-8.1




BOURBON COUNTY, K8
Cash Lead Sheet

C Cash.xls

December 31, 2021

County Treasurer
Treasurer's checking account-Landmark:

Treasurer's payroll & payble checking-Landmark

ACH Account
" SPARK checking
Jail Fund - UMB Checking

Unexplained Variance
Sublotal

ISF checks Fund 100
Subtotal - Treasurer's checking acounnts

Cash on Hand
Certificates of Deposit

City State Bank

Landmark Bank

Union State Bank

Liberty Savings

Total Cash -- Treasurer's Office

Outside offices
Count Clerk cash on hand

Clerk of the Dist Court law libr checking-UMB
Corrections center checking-Landmark

County attorney checking-UMB

Sheriffs accounts

Landmark checking
CSB checking

PREPARED BY
REVIEWED BY
Per C-1
AUDIT BOOK AIES AUDIT
BALANCE BALANCE DEBIT BALANCE
2020 2020 {(CREDIT) 2020 wp
13,294,018.26 17,112,518.77 17,112,518.77 C-1
1,129,543.16 241,208.82 241,208.82 C-1
- 1,527.29 1,527.26 C-1
14,932.45 337.53 337.53 C-i
331.39 - C-1
{13,933.40) - C-1
14,424 891.86 17,355,592.41 - - 17,355,592.41
4,380.88 11,106.30 11,106.30 OK
14,429,272 74 17,366,698.71 - - 17,366,698.71 C-1
1,700.00 - - - nc
600,000.00 600,000.00 - 600,000.00 C-6
100,000.00 100,000.00 - 100,000.00 C-6
740,000.00 740,000.00 - 740,000.00 C-6
200,060.00 200,000.00 - 200,000.00 C-6
1,640,060.00 1,640,000.00 - 1,640,000.00
16,070,972.74 19,006,698.7 1 - 19,006,698.71
40.00 - 40,00 S-3
16,014.07 - 17,338.90 §-5.2
92,148.49 - 133,996.44 86
74,680.55 - 41,936.64 S.7
18,814.10 25,828.94 S-8
16,272,669.95 19,006,698.71 219,140,92 19,225,839.63
OK A-4.1 OK A-4.4 OK A-4.]
Cash per A-4.4= 18,995,592 .41
Difference 11,106.30 =ISF Fund # 100




BOURBON COUNTY, KS

Reconciliations adjusted by auditor

C Cash.xis
December 31, 2021

12/31/21 Bank Balances
Outstanding Deposits
Outstanding Checks
Outstanding Wires
Other items

Variance

12/31/21 Reconciled Bal

12/31/21 Bank Baiances
Outstanding Deposits

Net posting errors

Net posting errors
Outstanding Checks
Ttems not in bank account

Net posting errors

Net posting errors

Vartance

12/31/21 Reconciled Bal

BALANCES PER "COMPOSITION OF CASH BALANCES AND INVESTMENTS REPORT

Per C-2 Per C-3 C-4 C-5 Totals per
Treasurer's Ck PR and AP ACH SPARK County

16,805,604.02 585,832.16 5,463.97  163,042.67 17,559,942.82

439,970.86 - - - 439,970.86
(22,445.85) (165,186.89) - - (187,632.74)
{132.14y (178,167.30) (178,299 .44)
(110,478.12} (1,269.15) (3,936.68) (162,705.14)  (278,389.09)

17,112,518.77 241,208.82 1,527.29 337.53  17,355,592.41

ADJUSTMENTS TO ACCOUNTING RECORDS

Treasurer's Ck PR and AP ACH SPARK Totals
a {(107,037.95) (107,037.95) (-2
b (162,705.14) (162,705.14) C-2
a 107,037.95 107,037.95
b 162,705.14 162,705.14 C-3.2

c22

(162,705.14)

162,705.14




BOURBON COUNTY, KS
Reconciliations adjusted by auditor
C Cashxls

December 31, 2021

ADJUSTED AUDIT BALANCES

Per C-2 Per C-3 Per C-4 Per C-5 Totals pet
Treasuret's Ck PR and AP ACH SPARK County
12/31/21 Bank Balances 16,805,604.02 17,559,942.82 C-2.1
585,832.16 C-3.1
5,463.97
163,042.67
Outstanding Deposits 170,227.77 - - - 170,227.77 C-2
Outstanding Checks {22,445.85) - - (187,632,714 C-2
(165,186.89) C-3
Outstanding Wires (132.14) {178,299.44)
: (178,167.30)
Items not recorded in gl (3,440.17) {8,646.00) C-2 (F)
(1,269.15) cC3 (B
(3,936.68) c4 (B
Variance - - - - C-3
12/31/21 Reconciled Bal 16,949,813.63 241,208.82 1,52729  163,042.67 17,355,592.41
(F) = Corrected in 2022
Unrecorded items
Items corrected in 2022 3,440.17 1,269.15 3,936.68 - 8,646.0¢
Errors in deposits (12,808.23) ~ (12,808.23)
ACH adjustments to deposits 3,936.68 <<<<<ogdadd] 3,936.68
(5,431.38) 1,269.15 3,936.68 - (225.55)
Wire transfers-add back to cash 132.14 178,167.30 178,299.44
Record related AP {132.14) (178,167.30) (178,299 .44)
(5,431.38) 1,269.15 3,936.68 - {225.55)

C-1.1
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BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS
ADJUSTING JOURNAL ENTRIES
'DECEMBER 31, 2021

FILE: Adjusting Journal Entries.xlsx ACCOUNT
FUND ACCOUNT NAME NUMBER DEBIT CREDIT
G = GENERAL JOURNAL ENTRIES
General Journal entries are adjustments that are made that are aceounting adjustments and not
necessarily due to auditing procedures performed. The following General Journal Entries were made
before actual audit procedures began, and should be posted in your accounting records as noted below.
G-1
GENERAL FUND - FUND BALANCE {1) Do Not Post 34,604.07
GENERAL FUND - EXPENSES {}} Do Not Post 34,604.07
COVID GRANTS FUND -FUND BALANCE {I' Do Not Post 34,604.07
COVID GRANTS FUND - EXPENSES (1) Do Not Post 34,604.07
GENERAL FUND - FUND BALANCE {2) Do Not Post 270.70
GENERAL FUND - RECEIPTS (2) Do NotPost 270.70
COMPUTER EQUIPMENT RESERVE FUND - FUND BALANCE {3) Do Not Post 2,391.96
COMPUTER EQUIPMENT RESERVE FUND - RECEIPTS {3) Do Not Post 2,391.96
TREASURERS TECH FUND - FUND BALANCE (3) Do Not Post 2,812.30
TREASURERS TECH FUND - RECEIPTS (3) Do Not Post 2,812.30
ROAD AND BRIDGE FUND - FUND BALANCE (3) Do Not Post 945.80
ROAD AND BRIDGE FUND - RECEIPTS (3) Do Not Post 945.80
AMBULANCE FUND - FUND BALANCE (2) Do NotPost 0.02
AMBULANCE FUND - RECEIPTS (2) Do Not Post 0.02
COVID GRANTS FUND -FUND BALANCE (1} Do NotPost 34,993.60
COVID GRANTS FUND - EXPENSES {1) Do NotPost 34,993.60
TO ADJUST FUND BALANCES FOR THE FOLLOWING:
(1} PY ADJUSTMENT TO CLOSE OUT COVID FUND NOT RECORDED
(2) INSIGNIFICANT ACTIVITY POSTED DIRECTLY TO FUND BALANCE
(3) VOIDED CHECKS CODED DIRECTLY TO FUND BALANCE
(4) ACTIVITY TO CLOSE OUT COVID FUND POSTED DIRECTLY TO FUND BALANCE
G-2
GENERAL FUND - CASH 001-00-0010 0.04
GENERAL FUND - DELINGQUENT TAX RECEIPTS (FUND BALANCE) 001-00-0040 0.04
JR COLLEGE TUITION FUND - RECEIPTS (FUND BALANCE) 104-00-0040 0.01
JR COLLEGE TUITION FUND - CASH 104-00-6010 0.01
SPECIAL LIABILITY FUND - RECEIPTS (FUND BALANCE) 242-00-0040 0.03
SPECIAL LIABILITY FUND - CASH 242-00-0010 0.03
TO RECLASSIFY TAX DISTRIBUTIONS TO DISCONTINUED FUNDS TO THE GENERAL FUND
A = AUDIT JOURNAL ENTRIES
Audit journal entries are adjustments to yoeur accounting records that came about due to audif procedures
They need to be posted in your accounting recorvds if they haven't been posted already.
These adjustments are posted in 2021, not in 2020,
A-1
CDPBG GRANT FUND - EXPENSES ‘ (13 Do Not Post 1,650.00
CDBG GRANT FUND - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE (1) Do Not Post £,650.00

TO RECORD PAYABLE FOR FINAL AMOUNT DUE TO SEKRPC FOR GRANT ADMINISTRATION
{THIS AMOUNT WAS PAID IN 2022)




BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS
ADJUSTING JOURNAL ENTRIES
'DECEMBER 31, 2021

FILE: Adjusting Journal Entries.xlsx ACCOUNT
FUND ACCOUNT NAME NUMBER DEBIT CREDIT
R= RECLASSIFICATION JOURNAL ENTRIES
Reclassification journal entries are adjustments to your accounting records to reclass
receipts and expenses normally to show more detail in the audited financial statement
than is shown in your acconnting records. These adjustments do not need to be recorded.
R-1
EMERGENCY MANAGE GRANT-RECEIPTS-FEDERAL GRANT {2) Do Not Record 16,912.35
EMERGENCY MANAGE GRANT-RECEIPTS-MISCELLANEOUS {(2) Do Not Record 16,912.35
PUBLIC SAFETY FUND-RECEIPTS-SHERIFF FEES (3) Do Not Record 93.56
PUBLIC SAFETY FUND-RECEIPTS-FEDERAL GRANT (3) Do Not Record 93.56
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-SPECIAL HIGHWAY {4) Do Not Record 31,135.56
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-COUNTY EQUALIZATION (4} Do Not Record 31,135.56
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-REIMBURSEMENTS {5) Do Not Record 376,047.29
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-FED EXCHANGE GRANT (5) Do Not Record 69,230.77
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-FED FEMA GRANT {5} Do Not Record 270,720.46
ROAD AND BRIDGE-RECEIPTS-ST FEMA GRANT {5} Do Not Record 36,096.06
MERCY MEDICAL BUILIDNG FUND-RECEIPTS-USER FEES {6} Do Not Record 600,000.00
MERCY MEDICAL BUILIDNG FUND-RECEIPTS--DONATION {6) Do Not Record 600,000.00
JAIL BOND AND INTEREST FUND-RECEIPTS-SALES TAX {7} Do Not Record 119,560.05
JAIL. BOND AND INTEREST FUND-RECEIPTS-MISCELLANEQUS (7} Do Not Record 119,560.05
SEWER DISTRICT #1-RECEIPTS-BOND PROCEEDS (1) Do Not Record 685,000.00
SEWER DISTRICT #1-MISCELLANEOUS (1} Do Not Record 685,000.00
TO RECLAS RECEIPTS AND EXPENSES FOR VARIOUS CODING ERRORS AS FOLLOWS:
(1) RECLAS BOND PROCEEDS CODED TO MISCELLANEOUS
(2) TO RECLASS GRANTS RECORDED AS MISCELLANEQUS RECEIPTS. FEDERAL
AND STATE GRANTS SHOULD BE SHOWN SEPARATE IN THE ACCOUNTING RECORDS.
(3} RECLASS FEDERAL GRANT CODED TO JAIL FEES
(4} COUNTY EQUALIZATION RECORDED AS SPECIAL HIGHWAY AID,
{5) RECLAS VARIOUS GRANTS CODED TO REIMBURSEMENTS
(6) TO RECLASS DONATION CODED TO USER FEES -
(7) TO RECLASS MISCELLANEQUS RECEIPT CODED TO SALES TAX -
R-2
PUBLIC SAFETY FUND-EXP-CONTRACTUAL Do Not Record 29,172.00
FUBLIC SAFETY FUND-EXP-DEBT SERVICE Do Not Record 29,172.00
ROAD AND BRIDGE-EXPENSES-CONTRACTUAL Do Not Record 52,000.00
ROAD AND BRIDGE-EXPENSES-LEASE PURCHASES Do Not Record 52,000.00
JAIL BOND AND INTEREST FUND-EXP-BOND PRINCIPAL Do Not Record 7,055.00
JAIL BOND AND INTEREST FUND-EXP-BOND INTEREST Do Not Record 18,474.75
JAIL BOND AND INTEREST FUND-OPERATING EXPENSES Do Not Record 25,529.75
SEWER DISTRICT #1-EXPENSE-CAPITAL PROJECTS Do Not Record 16,194.26
SEWER DISTRICT #1-EXPENSE-PRINCIPAL Do Not Record 16,194.26
LANDFILL FUND-EXPENSES-CONTRACTUAL Do Not Record 1.25
LANDFILL FUND-EXPENSES-INTEREST Do Not Record 1.25

TO RECLAS DEBT SERVICE TO AGREE WITH DETAIL LTD SCHEDULE OF ACTUAL PAYMENTS




BOURBON COUNTY, KANSAS
ADJUSTING JOURNAL ENTRIES
'DECEMBER 31, 2021

FILE: Adjusting Journal Entries.xlsx ACCOUNT
FUND ACCOUNT NAME NUMBER DEBIT CREDIT
R-3
GENERAL FUND-TRANSFERS OUT- Do Not Record 16,000.00
GENERAL FUND-EXPENSES-AMBULANCE Do Not Record 16,000.00
ELECTION EQUIPMENT FUND-RECEIPTS-TRANSFERS Do Not Record 28,000.00
ELECTION EQUIPMENT FUND-RECEIPTS-TRANSFERS-GENERAL Do Not Record 8.,000.00
ELECTION EQUIPMENT FUND-RECEIPTS-TRANSFERS-ELECTION Do Not Record 20,000.00
TO RECLAS OTHER INCOME INCLUDED IN TRANSFER IN ACCOUNT,
R-5
SEWER DISTRICT #2 FUND-RECEIPTS-BOND PREMIUM Do Not Record 5,743.25
SEWER DISTRICT #2 FUND-EXPENSES-CAPITAL PROJECTS Do Not Record 5,743.25
TO RECLASS PREMIUM RECEIVED ON BONDS
2,113,661.92  2,113,661.92




